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“Try to enter in on
the scene taking part
as just one more
person there”

How I wish your bearing and
conversation were such that, on
seeing or hearing you, people
would say: This man reads the
life of Jesus Christ. (The Way, 2)

3 October

When you open the Holy Gospel,
think that what is written there ‑‑ the
words and deeds of Christ ‑‑ is
something that you should not only



know, but live. Everything, every
point that is told there, has been
gathered, detail by detail, for you to
make it come alive in the individual
circumstances of your life. God has
called us Catholics to follow him
closely. In that holy Writing you will
find the Life of Jesus, but you should
also find your own life there. You too,
like the Apostle, will learn to ask, full
of love, ``Lord, what would you
have me do?'' And in your soul you
will hear the conclusive answer,
``The Will of God!'' Take up the
Gospel every day, then, and read it
and live it as a definite rule. This is
what the saints have done. (The
Forge, 754)

If you wish to get close to Our Lord
through the pages of the Gospels, I
always recommend that you try to
enter in on the scene taking part as
just one more person there. In this
way (and I know many perfectly
ordinary people who live this way)



you will be captivated like Mary was,
who hung on every word that Jesus
uttered or, like Martha, you will
boldly make your worries known to
him, opening your heart sincerely
about them all no matter how little
they may be [1]. (Friends of God, 222)

[1] cf Luke 10:39-40
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